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1.   MINUTES AND ACTIONS  1 - 6 

 To approve as an accurate record and the Chair to sign the minutes 
of the meeting of the Health & Wellbeing Board held on 9 September 
2015. 

 

2.   APOLOGIES FOR ABSENCE   

3.   DECLARATIONS OF INTEREST   

 If a Member of the Board, or any other member present in the meeting 
has a disclosable pecuniary interest in a particular item, whether or not it 
is entered in the Authority’s register of interests, or any other significant 
interest which they consider should be declared in the public interest, 
they should declare the existence and, unless it is a sensitive interest as 
defined in the Member Code of Conduct, the nature of the interest at the 
commencement of the consideration of that item or as soon as it 
becomes apparent. 
 
At meetings where members of the public are allowed to be in 
attendance and speak, any Member with a disclosable pecuniary 
interest or other significant interest may also make representations, give 
evidence or answer questions about the matter.  The Member must then 
withdraw immediately from the meeting before the matter is discussed 
and any vote taken.  
 
Where members of the public are not allowed to be in attendance and 
speak, then the Member with a disclosable pecuniary interest should 
withdraw from the meeting whilst the matter is under consideration. 
Members who have declared other significant interests should also 
withdraw from the meeting if they consider their continued participation 
in the matter would not be reasonable in the circumstances and may 
give rise to a perception of a conflict of interest. 
 
Members are not obliged to withdraw from the meeting where a 
dispensation to that effect has been obtained from the Audit, Pensions 
and Standards Committee.   

 

4.   FLU ACTION PLAN 2015/2016: UPDATE  7 - 15 

 This report provides details of the work that has been undertaken by 
NHS England, Public Health and Hammersmith & Fulham CCG, both 
jointly and independently, to increase vaccine uptake. In addition, future 
action plans are described.   

 

5.   LIKE MINDED: NORTH WEST LONDON MENTAL HEALTH & 
WELLBEING STRATEGY: CASE FOR CHANGE  

16 - 35 

 This report sets out the background to the development of North West 
London Mental Health and Wellbeing Strategy Case for Change, as part 

 



of the Like Minded Programme. 

6.   BETTER CARE FUND: UPDATE  36 - 45 

 This report is the regular update on progress with the delivery of the 
Better Care Fund (BCF).   

 

7.   LOCAL SAFEGUARDING CHILDREN BOARD ANNUAL REPORT  46 - 106 

 The Annual Report for 2014/15 reviews and evaluates the achievements 
and progress of the Local Safeguarding Children Board which covers 
Hammersmith & Fulham, Kensington and Chelsea and Westminster. It 
also identifies future priorities and an assessment of challenges faced 
going forward. 

 

8.   DATES OF NEXT MEETINGS   

 The Board is asked to note that the dates of the meetings scheduled for 
the municipal year 2015/2016 are as follows:  
 
9 February 2016 
21 March 2016 

 

 


